HARYANA VIDHAN SABHA SECRETARIAT
No. HVS-LA-41/2025/.9 o6 9 Dated: & December, 2025

" NOTICE

Since the prorogation of the last August, 2025 of the Haryana Vidhan Sabha, the

Govemor of the State of Haryana has promulgated the Haryana Shops and Commercial
Establishments (Amendment) Ordinance, 2025 (Haryana Ordinance No. 4 of 2025).

To

A copy of the said Ordinances (in English) is sent herewith as required under
Rule 168(1) of the Rules of Procedure and Conduct of Business in the Haryana
Legislative Assembly

The aforesaid Ordinance will also be laid before the Haryana Vidhan Sabha
during its ensuing Session.

The said Ordinance shall cease to operate at the expiration of six weeks from the
commencement of the Session of the Haryana Vidhan Sabha, or if before the
expiration of the said period a resolution disapproving the same is passed by the
Haryana Vidhan Sabha, upon the passing of the resolution (vide Article 213 2)
of the Constitution of India). Within this period any member may, after giving
three days notice to the Secretary, move a resolution disapproving the above

mentioned Ordinance.

Y. Supermtendent
for Secretary.

All the Members of the Haryana Vidhan Sabha.




Hargana Gouernment Gazette

EXTRAORDINARY

Published by Authority
© Govt. of Haryana

No. 187-2025/Ext.] CHANDIGARH, WEDNESDAY, NOVEMBER 12, 2025
(KARTIKA 21, 1947 SAKA)

LEGISLATIVE SUPPLEMENT
CONTENTS
PART-1  ACTS
NI r
PART-I ORDINANCES

THE HARYANA SHOPS AND COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS
(AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2025

(HARYANA ORDINANCE NO.4 OF 2025).
PART-1I1 DELEGATED LEGISLATION
NIL
PART-IV CORRECTION SLIPS, REPUBLICATIONS AND REPLACEMENTS

Corrigendum in the Haryana Government,
Food Civil Supplies and Consumer Affairs Department,
No. S.0. 38/C.A.35/2019/S.102/2024, dated the 24th July, 2024

(Only in English Text).

(Ixxxiv)

PAGES
37—39
39




HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), NOV. 12, 2025 (KRTK. 21, 1947 SAKA)

7

PART - 11
HARYANA GOVERNMENT
LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT
Notification
The 12th November, 2025

No. Leg. 27/2025.— The following Ordinance of the Governor of Haryana promulgated
under clause (1) of article 213 of the Constitution of India, on the 11th November, 2025, is hereby
published for general information:-

HARYANA ORDINANCE NO. 4 OF 2025
THE HARYANA SHOPS AND COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS
(AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2025
AN
ORDINANCE _
Sfurther 10 amend the Haryana Shops and Commercial Establishments Act, 1938.
Promulgated by the Governor of Haryana in the Seventy-sixth Year of the Republic of

India.

Whereas the Legislature of the State of Haryana is not in session and the Governor of
Haryana is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate
action; '

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of article 213 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor of Haryana is hereby promulgate the following Ordinance:-

1. -(1) This Ordinance may be called the Haryana Shops and Commercial Establishments
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2025.

(2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.

2; After sub-section (4) of section 1 of the Haryana Shops and Commercial Establishments Act,
1958 (hereinafter called the principal Act), the following sub-section shall be added, namely :-

“(5) The provisions of this Act except section 13A shall apply to the shops and
establishments employing twenty or more workers and provisions of section 13A of this
Act shall apply to the shops and establishments empbyi—ng less than twenty workers.”.

3. In section 7 of the principal Act ,-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "nine hours", the words "ten hours" shall be
substituted; and

(i) in sub-section (2), in the proviso, in clause (a), for the word "fifty", the words and
sign "one hundred fifty-six" shall be substituted.
4. In sub-section (1) of section 8 of the principal Act, for the words “five hours”, the words

“six hours” shall be substituted.

5. For section 13 of the principal Act, the following sections shall be substituted, namely :-

“13. Registration of establishments.- (1) The employer of every establishment
employing twenty or more workers shall, within a period of one month from the date of
commencement of his business, submit an application online in such form, together with
such fee and documents, as may be prescribed, containing-

(a) the name of the employer and the manager, if any;

(b) postal address along with GPS location of the establishment;
(¢) name of the establishment;

(d) number of persons employed in the establishment;

(e) nature of the business of an establishment; and

(f)  such other particulars, as may be prescribed.

Short title and

commencement.

Amendment of
section 1 of
Punjab Act 15
of 1958.

Amendment of
section 7 of
Punjab Act 15
of 1958.

Amendment of
section 8 of
Punjab Act 15
of 1958.
Substitution of
section 13 of
Punjab Act 15
of 1958.




8

HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), NOV. 12, 2025 (KRTK. 21, 1947 SAKA)

Amendment of
section 19 of
Punjab Act 15
of 1958.

Amendment of
section 20 of
Punjab Act 15
of 1958.

6.

(2) On receipt of an application along with documents and fee, the Inspector shall
verify the correctness of the application and documents attached thereto and on being
satisfied shall issue online registration certificate to the employer in such form, as may be
prescribed within the time limit as notified under the Haryana Right to Service Act, 2014
(4 of 2014).

(3) A registration certificate issued under sub-section (2) shall be valid until it is
amended or cancelled upon closing of the establishment or revoked by the Inspector after
verification, on such conditions and manner, as may be prescribed.

(4) It shall be the duty of the employer to intimate the Inspector online, any change
in the particulars furnished in the application submitted for registration within a period of
seven days after the change has taken place, in such form, as may be prescribed.

(5) In case of change with regard to the name of establishment, employer, manager
and work force details, the employer shall make an application for amended registration
certificate as per the provisions of sub-section (2) and no fee shall be charged for issuance
of amended registration certificate.

(6) The employer shall intimate to the Inspector online about closing of the
establishment, within thirty days of closing. The Inspector shall, on receiving the
information and being satisfied about the correctness, remove the name of such
establishment from the register of establishment and cancel the registration certificate.

(7) In case of any contravention of, or failure to comply with the provisions of this
section, the employer shall be liable to a penalty which shall not be less than three thousand
rupees but may extend to ten thousand rupees for the first violation and in case of second
violation, he shall be liable to a penalty which shall not be less than five thousand rupees
but may extend to twenty-five thousand rupees:

Provided that in case of continuous subsequent violation, the competent authority, as
specified by the Government, may impose penalty at the rate of five hundred rupees for
every day.

13A. Intimation of establishment employing less than twenty workers.- The
employer of every establishment employing less than twenty workers shall, within a period
of one month from the date of commencement of his business, submit online intimation to
the Inspector in such form, as may be prescribéd. The employer providing intimation shall
be provided a Basic Information Performa ID Number.”.

In sub-section (3) of section 19 of the principal Act, for the words and figure “section 21 of

the Indian Penal Code”, the words, figures and brackets “clause (28) of section 2 of the Bharatiya
Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (Central Act 45 of 2023)” shall be substituted.

7

For sub-sections (5) and (6) of section 20 of the principal Act, the following sub-sections

shall be substituted, namely :-

“(5) In the case of any contravention of the foregoing provisions of this section, the
employer of an establishment shall be liable to a penalty not exceeding five hundred rupees
for every day during which the contravention occurs or continues.

(6) If any person with intent to deceive, makes, or causes, or allows to be made, in
any such record, register or notice as aforesaid an entry which is to his knowledge false in
any material particular, or wilfully omits or causes or allows to be omitted from any such
record, register or notice an entry required to be made therein, he shall be liable to a penalty
which shall not be less than three thousand rupees but may extend to ten thousand rupees
for the first violation and in case of second violation, he shall be liable to a penalty which
shall not be less than five thousand rupees but may extend to twenty-five thousand rupees:

Provided that in case of continuous subsequent violation, the competent authority,
as specified by the Government may impose penalty at the rate of five hundred rupees for
every day.”.




HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), NOV. 12, 2025 (KRTK. 21, 1947 SAKA) 39

9.

After section 20 of the principal Act, the following sections shall be inserted, namely:-
“20A. Appointment letter.- Every employer of an establishment shall furnish to all
his employees with the letter of appointment, having affixed the photograph of employee
and obtain acknowledgement thereto.
20B. Identity card.- Every employer of an establishment shall furnish to every
worker an identity card containing such particulars, as may be prescribed.”.

For sub-section (2) of section 21 of the principal Act, the following sub-section shall be

substituted, namely:-

10.

CHANDIGARH:
THE 11th November, 2025.

“(2) Whoever contravenes the provisions of sub-section (1) or wilfully obstructs the
inspecting authority in the exercise of the powers under this Act or conceals or prevents
any employee in an establishment from appearing before or being examined by the
authority, shall be liable to a penalty which shall not be less than three thousand rupees but
which may extend to ten thousand rupees.”.

For section 26 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely :-

“26. Penalties.- Subject to the other provisions of this Act, whoever contravenes
any of the provisions of this Act or the rules made thereunder and no penalty has been
provided for such contravention in this Act, shall be liable to a penalty which shall not be
less than three thousand rupees but which may extend to ten thousand rupees for the first
violation and in case of second violation, he shall be liable to a penalty which shall not be
less than five thousand rupees but may extend to twenty-five thousand rupees:

Provided that in case of continuous subsequent violation, the competent authority,
as specified by the Government may impose penalty at the rate of five hundred rupees for
every day.”. -

PROF. ASHIM KUMAR GHOSH
GOVERNOR OF HARYANA

RITU GARG, .
ADMINISTRATIVE SECRETARY TO GOVERNMENT, HARYANA,
LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT.

12213—L.R—H.G.P., Pkl

Insertion of
section 20A and
20B in Punjab
Act 15 of 1958.

Amendment of
section 21 of
Punjab Act 15 of
1958.

Substitution of
section 26 of
Punjab Act

15 of 1958.




gRIOT R w9 aRETe

¥, AR —TAG~41 /2025 /AF 609  Reifea /S e, 2025

il

BIRATON = F97 & 71 SRR, 2025 & N & € .

BRATT 5 & YU A ERAT. gHER T e yRie
(VM) STEATC, 2025 (2025 BT ERATON AT F. 4) TR by

=

1.

ERAVT Qe w91 & wfehar den orf Sare | Faet o
=9 168 (1 ()E%a%ﬁﬁﬂwaﬁf%ﬁwaawlq%laﬁwqﬁf
(&13f) gD |rer Il Y ¥

JaieRT AT BT ERATON Y T & AR 89 a7y ory
SN |3 H o1 <=aT STQTT |

ST AT, ERATOM T A4 BT T IRA BN I O e
DI IR WX, 3(aT Al I HIaafy B iy J g 9w
PRI @1 dden sRam fae w9 gRT RS & er §
EﬁWWsﬁWuqﬁﬁﬁW(ﬂﬁﬁ%ﬂﬁaﬁzﬁ
ITET 213 (2) BRI | T BN & ofex P W Ty
Wﬁ?ﬂ?ﬁ?ﬂ%‘ﬁ:ﬂmw?ﬁqwlq SURATT IR B

(FRIAIE BT Hdhed URgd B FeeT © |
)t
<0 6\\;\”

(W%ﬁ?ﬁ%’)
- 3R wfRg,
@:‘Hﬁﬁfl

SRATT O™ G991 & ST SR |



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), NOV. 26, 2025 (AGHN. 5, 1947 SAKA) 97

HRT—11
fafer gom faemiy favrT
SfergET
feie 26 IR, 2025
& O 27 /2025— & BRuOn winw Uve dESfa sHeq-fow—ie (BMrsHw)
3itfRS=, 2025 &1 Fr=ifiiaa = argare sRaTT & ISTUTd BT f3AT® 19 AR, 2025 BT

el & aefiF vaggRT SR fhar oar 8 ik I8 gk rorrar g, 1969 (1969
BT 17) B ORT 4—5 B U (1) B N Saa AR F1 R A1 § yrfored qrs qHet

ST~

2025 T SRATON AT GE&AT 4

RGO gHMTT T aIfias aRror (Weier) s, 2025
BRAT g@M e At ufter s, 1958
BT AR HR
F @ fog
TR

HRA TURGY & foeded ayf & eRamon & Irsuurd §RT e |

e eRamT g Rurrse @ 99 T8l 81 W8T € 9 ISguTe $ Axgie 8 TS ®
fo5 Wl uRRerfergi femm € R R qRed BRATE BT I9a oY 31aeae 81 T &

S, 319 WRd & WU & gTe] 213 B WUS (1) §RT Uaw wfdqdl &I HANT
TR gY, BRI & ISTUe, TAG g, Fifead sfeamder i & g—

1. (1) ue sy ERAOT geME den At ufoter  (Weie) stegree, 2025
BB ST BT 2 |

2) I IoUF H sHS USHRE B AR § Ay e |
2. BRumT gaEa qen aiftiae vl sfdfam, 1958 (R, swH, g@ @1C o

WWW%)H%W1aé’rw—am@)a%arﬁ:,ﬁwf%ﬁﬁw—wmﬁ@mwﬂ,
3rrf—

“(5) &IRT 13% & Rara 391 AfRfFaH & Sudy 99 a1 SHN Afdd PHBRI B
IR BT aTel gt iR U IR AR BT 3R T S @1 aRT 138 @
U I W BH HHGRI BT FARIT B arel gabr! iR YRS R AR 81 1 |
3. o iffae @1 aRr 7 H-
() Su—uRT (1) ¥ A geel” Rk & @A W, ™ Tl vreg gfcrenfua ey

SO, T
(i) SU-uRT (2) H W H W (F) H TER TR b W W D A s
vreg gforenfua farg S | ‘
4. A IAFEH @ gRT 8 @ SU—wRT (1) H, U@ "o el B W W BE g
vreg gfoRenfua farg o | .

5 uol IRfT @ aRT 13 & e W, ferfoRad aR uftrenfa @1 Sme, srerfq—
13, UfASHET BT Golidror—(1) 7 a1 SEN 31t HHBRI Bl IR B
el U Gl BT e, 307 BRI & TR &) Ay & g A @) 3@y &
AR, W ooy A, A B 3R gxaraeti, ot fafgd fey oImd, @ amer sifvetrs amdes
g e, o fefafed @R feg Smdi—

wféreT = qer
TR |

1958 ® GoId
arferfrm 15 @
GRT 1 Bl
A |

1958 & UGTd
e 15 @1
&RT 7 T
I |

1958 @ oI
rfrfrm 15 @
¢RT 8 T
HEMNE |
1958 ® GoIg
srferfas 15 @t
SRT 13 T
TfoReIu= |



98

1958 & GOl
arfefr 15
DI aRT 19 BT
AR |

1958 & Yol
arfefas 15
P LRI 20 T
XN |

HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), NOV. 26, 2025 (AGHN. 5, 1947 SAKA)

RIS a1 yeRIS BT A, Ife BIg 8,
yfosE @ SidLw. saRerfa |fdd Sre—udr;
gfrse™ &1 A,
g # Frnfda aafeal @1 |,
) ufre™ @& HRAR B Ul d

T o= &R, o fafkd fby g |

) TR ok B @ Wi e we B W, e, Jided 3R S| el
AT @ emefar @) Sifa e sl Wi @9 W FRIee @ W wed, St fafed fear
ST, ¥ R JaT BT AER SIRfFRE, 2014 (2014 BT 4) B AT JAT STERRAT FHI—AHT
3 fox PRSI B BiFaTET USTeRT THIO—T SR &N |

() SU-UNT (2) & DA S BT AT BT YOO THV-TA 9 b de B,
W9 dF AR T AT ST a1 gRieH @ g6 8 WR IGE el 7 fadr Srar ar e
NI Sifg & @& vvare, O wal wosik Oxft Ay, o fAfgw @ e, § gferdever w€ fhar
ST |

(@) FRSE $7 I8 Bda 86 & 98 dohe}el & fau oRgd ey MY smdee # 3y
Ty fagwoit 3 et o aRads @ qaen, IRadH @ & 9 T @ WA W gy, o fafed
fepar Sy, ¥ et &1 sifes <d |

(6) uRrsm, FrirsTd, gawrd & = 3R wrigd faawol & aww § gRada & amel
¥ FriTs, SU—oRT (2) & Sual & AR AR YoliaRor JHOT—us & o 3rrded B
3R N UoiiepRoT JHIO—Usl SRl &= & oY BIg W TaIRd &l &l ST |

6) fro, ufem @ o< 89 & IR #, 9= 89 & A9 T & Wiar FRes @
siferetTg i ey | e, gEeT w8 TR R S Fmeidr ® R # 6gT g W,
yRre™ @ Irer § A W yfde™ @r 9 geT Q- 3R UOiieRe GHI-U3 Bl RGE DY
T

CRERGIC)

)

g4

=

(7) =9 9R & SugHil & B W Sooiud, AT B AU PR H IRTHE e
@ Aer ¥, Frdied, yeM Seetad & forg, Wi wRa @ forg Rl g, S 9 E9R w9 9
Waﬁﬂﬁﬁﬂﬁﬁmwmwwaﬁﬁﬂﬁaﬁ?ﬁﬁamﬁnmﬁﬁ
g8 U wRa & forg er 8, S Ufd B9IR ®UY W $H DI Al 8 Febdll fbg Ted gOIR
®IY TH DI BT DI
: Re] AR ST Sediel & Al ¥, PR GRT FAqT ﬁﬁﬁ‘% e
T, yd® fos & fofg dfa golk wUY @ &% A R ARRIAT B A |
13%. 91 U BH BHGR B PRI w1 el gl @ gE- 9 9 wd
FHBRI P AT BT dTel YAS TS T FAITd, U+ HRAR DI YR™
B B AR Th AN B ey & iy FRied Bl U gy, o fafed fear
WY, # 3fFergd GoE WRgd BT | GA oF drel RIS @ U qel A
T 3MS0I0 T &1 ST | |

6. T AAFEE P URT 19 B IT-GRT (3) H, TR U WRAT 9T URT 21" &R} qen
Ipl B M W, "MRAT =1 Hiddl, 2023 (2023@@%‘1?13@%@45)3%%2&%@3
(28)" wrw, it T ISP il fby SIY |

Waﬁﬁwaﬁwzo?ﬁw— (5) @ (6) & M W}, fefoiRad Su—¢Rig
uﬁ‘mﬁﬁaﬁm arerfe—

"(6) 39 GRT & YA -l o Sus @ fl Sooiew @ WA #, faed
g™ &1 fee, W Ul fod, R SR Sooigd BT ® A7 SN YEdT ', B
fou U oRa & forw i 8, S ufa Y wuy | 3ifed a8l 81 el |

(6) afe ®IT afaq, ovar 3 & <MYy &, JUMalad fHA U 3rf¥eld, ool a1
Fﬁ%ﬂﬁﬁiﬁaﬁégﬁﬁa W%mwémmwaﬁeﬂgw HRAT ©, Sl IADI
el & AR fefl aifcas fafife o sfic & fRear &, a1 fei o sifvrer,
qcﬁm:ﬁ%ﬂﬁwﬁﬁmmﬁa?mﬂmmﬁqﬁ&wmms@maﬁtrwcn%‘?JT




HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), NOV. 26, 2025 (AGHN. 5, 1947 SAKA)

99

AT BRATET ¥ AT AT BRI B IAG bRl 2, O 98 W e @ oy TRAY
R & forg TR BNT, S 9 B9R ®UY W HH @I 781 8 A, fbg a9 R
ST qF B B g R Fdy SeceAr & Wl #, 98 Y wiRd & fog <&
mﬁwmwﬁwﬁﬂﬁﬁﬂﬁﬁ foreg TR EIR WYY Ab Bl B
HH:
Ueg AR ST e B AMGl #, WeR grr g fafdfds wem
R TRe 2 & firg dfe | wuy @ ) 9 R fRIftT BRI ||

wol SfifrEE @ aRT 20 @ are, FrEfaRed aRe & S, s

"20%. FRIfR o~ el ufro™ @1 TR FRiSe s el dEarRar o
R = T, O IR BHER) BT Bl RuwT B T SHS! Ui 9T v |

209, UEAT UH.— WWWWWWW@WW
g3 <, R W R wfer g, o fafka fee Sme ||

aol SRR B GRT 21 B ST-URT (2) B W W, FrEfaRad Su-awT gfavenfid

Eb“rwﬁ RDIES

10.

UG

feTid 1

"(2) ST BIE N SU—URT (1) B SUGHIT BT SoeTed PRAT & A1 9 ARH B
aef wifacal &1 wAnT R H FRleror wiferery I HRAT © AT
gfereT™ ¥ Rl S B WRE & A SURed 8 9 AT WIiHier gRT aNifard
fFy o A fourar € a1 Jar ®, dF 98 T wRa @ fay SRl g, o 9 geiR
Wﬁﬂﬁﬂﬁﬁﬂﬁﬁﬁﬂﬂ%ﬁﬂwmiﬁﬁmll

aﬁaﬁﬁaﬁaﬁwza?ﬁv{mﬁrw frfoRad gy uftrenfia @ Srge, sreriq—

e |mrgwsmquaﬂﬁa%%‘rwﬂ3ﬁ?@?ﬁﬂmﬂ?%wfr g8 U
e @ g R BT, S Ui E9IR WY | B9 $I A6l 8 A ldnvguvqlﬁg\'rﬂ?
wmaﬁa‘r@ﬁ

AR ST Seaigd @ 9l d, WReR gRT e fafafdse e’

m@ﬂmﬁﬁzﬁﬁmwﬁwﬁmﬁwmwmll

Tlo 3R FAR I,

9 TqHR, 2025. RTSUTe, BRI |

Rg i,
T afd, gRATIT TR,
fafey gorr e T |

12243—L.R—H.G.P., Pkl

1958 ® GOl
s 15 #
GRT 205 3R
20% BT 3@l
SIHT |

1958 ® GOId
frferm 15 @
GRT 21 @l
R |

1958 @ TUSId
arfarfrm 15 @
IRT 26 BT
TfaReu= |



